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OFFICIAL RULES 

NO PURCHASE IS NECESSARY TO ENTER OR WIN. A PURCHASE OR PAYMENT OF 
ANY KIND WILL NOT INCREASE YOUR CHANCES OF WINNING. 

Agreement to Official Rules. Participation in the Tiger Lily Sweetheart Gift Package Giveaway 
Sweepstakes (the “Sweepstakes”) constitutes entrant’s full and unconditional agreement to and 
acceptance of these Official Rules and the decisions of Sponsor (as defined below), which are 
final and binding. Winning a prize is contingent upon fulfilling all requirements set forth herein. 
The Sweepstakes is sponsored by Summerlin Operating Company, 1700 South Pavilion Center 
Drive Suite 250, Las Vegas, NV 89135 (“Sponsor”). [This Sweepstakes is in no way sponsored, 
endorsed, or administered by, or associated with, Instagram or Facebook. Any questions, 
comments, or complaints regarding the Sweepstakes must be directed to Sponsor, and not to 
Instagram or Facebook. You are providing your information to Sponsor and not to Instagram or 

Facebook.] 

Odds. The odds of winning will be determined by the number of eligible entries received. 

Eligibility. The Sweepstakes is open only to residents of, and physically located within, Nevada, 
who are at least eighteen (18) years of age or older as of the date of entry. All directors, officers, 
and employees of Sponsor and its parent companies, subsidiaries, affiliates, sales representatives, 
distributors, licensees, agents, advertising and Sweepstakes agencies, and each of their 
immediate family members (spouses, parents, children, and siblings and their respective 
spouses), and those living in the same household as each, are not eligible to participate in the 
Sweepstakes. The Sweepstakes is subject to all applicable federal, state, and local laws and 

regulations. Void where prohibited. 

Entry Period. The Sweepstakes entry period begins on Saturday, February 8, 2025, at 10:00 
AM Pacific Standard Time (“PST”) and ends on Sunday, February 9, 2025, at 11:59 PM PST 
(the “Entry Period”). Sponsor’s computer shall be the official time-keeping device for the 
Sweepstakes. 

How to Enter; Limit on Entries. To enter the Sweepstakes, during the Entry Period, participants 
must opt-in to the Downtown Summerlin SMS program by visiting the opt-in page and filling 
out the registration form. Only entries submitted during the Entry Period will be accepted. Limit 
one (1) entry per person. 

Random Drawing; Winner Verification. Potential prize winner(s) will be selected from a 
random drawing conducted by Sponsor on Monday, February 10, 2025. The potential winner 
will be notified via SMS on Monday, February 10, 2025 at 10 AM PST. Each potential winner 
may be required to execute and return an affidavit of eligibility/liability release and, where 
lawful, a publicity release within 48 hours of the date of issuance. If such potential winner 
declines in writing to accept a prize, any Sponsor-required documents are not returned on time, 



prize or prize notification is returned as undeliverable, the Sponsor is unable to contact a 
potential winner within a reasonable time period, or a potential winner is not otherwise in 
compliance with these Official Rules, the prize will be forfeited and, at the Sponsor’s sole 
discretion and time permitting, an alternate winner may be selected from all remaining eligible 

entries. Limit one (1) prize in the Sweepstakes per entrant. 

Prizes. One (1) winner will receive a Tiger Lily Sweetheart Gift Package, valued at $79.95, 
which includes a bear, assorted Nectar bath products, chocolates, a balloon, and a small bouquet 
of flowers. Prize will be awarded “as is” with no warranty, guarantee, or representations, either 
express or implied by Sponsor. No cash substitutions or exchanges allowed, except at Sponsor’s 

sole discretion. 

Publicity/Use Rights. By accepting any prize, each entrant consents to the use of entrant’s 
name, voice, and likeness, via all forms of media now known or hereafter devised worldwide, in 

perpetuity, without notice, attribution, or compensation, except where prohibited by law. 

Privacy. By participating in the Sweepstakes, entrant authorizes Sponsor to collect, use, process, 
transfer, and store all data provided by entrant for purposes of administration of the Sweepstakes. 
All information submitted to Sponsor as part of this Sweepstakes will be treated in accordance 

with Sponsor’s privacy statement, available at https://summerlin.com/privacy-policy/. 

Release and Limitations on Liability. By participating in the Sweepstakes, entrants agree to 
release and hold harmless Sponsor, Instagram, Facebook, and their respective parent companies, 
subsidiaries, affiliates, and advertising agencies (the “Released Parties”) from and against any 
claim or cause of action arising out of participation in the Sweepstakes, or receipt or use of any 
prize, including but not limited to: (a) unauthorized human intervention; (b) technical errors 
related to computers, servers, or telephone or network lines; (c) printing errors; (d) lost, late, or 
misdirected entries; (e) injury or damage to persons or property arising from entrant’s 
participation or prize acceptance. 

Miscellaneous. The decisions of Sponsor are final with respect to all aspects of this 
Sweepstakes. The Sweepstakes and these Official Rules will be governed by the laws of the State 
of Nevada. Any disputes shall be resolved individually, without resort to class action, exclusively 

by the United States District Court for Clark County or the applicable state court in Nevada. 

Winners List; Official Rules. For notification of the winner (first name, first initial of last name) 
and/or a copy of these Official Rules, send a self-addressed, stamped envelope to: Tiger Lily 
Sweetheart Gift Package Giveaway Sweepstakes, c/o Summerlin Operating Company, 1700 
South Pavilion Center Drive, Suite 250, Las Vegas, NV 89135. Requests for the winners list 
must be received after Friday, February 9, 2025, at 10:00 AM PST. 

Sponsor. The Sponsor of this Sweepstakes is Summerlin Operating Company. Entrants shall not 
use the trademarks of Sponsor or falsely associate themselves with Sponsor during or after the 
Entry Period. 
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